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ABSTRACT 

After independence, India faces many problems in each sector and one of 
them is defence. Through time and patience, we developed and evolved, and 

realised our loopholes. Currently Indian military ranks four out of 145 in the 

annual global firepower index after the USA, Russia, and China (2023 
Military Strength Ranking, n.d.). To maintain, improve and upgrade the 

military, India’s spending on defence infrastructure is increasing year after 
year. The defence ministry gets one of the biggest parts of India’s funds. 

There is various in-house production as well as joint ventures with foreign 
defence companies. 
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I. HOW MILITARY SPENDING AFFECTS THE ECONOMY 

 
According to Stockholm International Peace Research Institute, the five biggest 
spenders in 2019 were Saudi Arabia, India, United States, Russia, and China and 
together they made around 60% of global military expenditure. The spending with 
any government investment has an impact on the GDP of the nations that made 
them build stronger. Due to the limited supply of capital putting more money into 
one category of spending equals less money for another. This fact becomes more 
urgent when we consider that government spending exceeds government budget 
revenue. This results in a form of deficit. It would impact the growth of the economy 
as, if government start spending on a single activity, it would increase their debt to 
develop other activities and could also increase the taxes paid by the people. 
Somehow, if government choose to spend their revenue in a way that could produce 
or improve its defences. to increase the growth of the economy and maintain peace 
the government took various steps  (Beattie, 2021). 
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II. GOVERNMENT INITIATIVES 
 
1) For boosting and developing economies government approved five projects in 

2022-2023 under make-1. 
2) To ensure the non-intrusive, the government targets to modernise the QA 

procedure.  
3) For domestic industry, the government would keep 68% of the capital 

procurement budget. 
4) The government would streamline the industrial licencing process along with a 

longer authentication period. 
5) SRIJAN portal would be launched which is an indigenisation portal to help and 

support indigenisation by Indian entities. 
6) In Uttar Pradesh and Tamil Nadu two defence corridors each one would be 

launched (Aatmanirbharta in Defence, 2022). 
 
III. WHY DOES INDIA NEED SUCH HIGH MILITARY POWER? 

 
After independence, Indian political leaders were in favour to reduce military funds 
and strength. During the war with China Sino-Indian war in 1962 India realised the 
necessity and weakness of the Indian forces. It realised its mistakes and blunders 
in “forward policy” India is a peaceful nation, and no one will attack us as we have 
no enemies. After the 1947-1948 and 1965 Indo-Pak war, the 1971 Bangladesh 
liberation war and the Kargil war we realised the deficiency of adequate weapons, 
and defence infrastructure like roads naval bases, air force airports, various 
organisations, and technology. Soldiers were using old and inefficient weapons, and 
lack of some essential equipment to perform operations in the fields (Indian Defence 
Review (IDR), n.d.). It was not like we are falling behind as such but not sufficient 
for such a big nation that had to compete with nations like China, USA, France, 

England etc. (Kapoor, 2017). 
 

One more lesson we learned was that we made many enemies directly and indirectly 
during the process. Big and developed nations didn’t want India to become a threat 
and competition to them. Pakistan in the rage of revenge and hate of defeat in war 
and Bangladesh’s independence started operations like terrorism in various parts of 
India especially Kashmir, the parliament attack, and 26/11 also funded and 
supported events like insurgency in Punjab which poses threat to its internal 
security. A nation faces threats both from outside and inside.  

 
Its operation to bleed India with thousand cuts to make India always get busy in its 
internal conflicts and stop its progress-developments, hurt the unity and integrity of 
our beloved country. To counter such events, we need a big change which came in 
each passing year with the Ministry of the defence establishment and change of 
thinking. Earlier we didn’t think we had to face such wars and hate from 
neighbours after facing the consequences of our negligence and inability to strategic 
decisions and policies a specialised organisation was formed. 
 
After independence, the ministry of defence was formed under cabinet minister and 
each service army, navy and air force with a head called the chief of army staff, 
chief of naval staff and chief of air staff in 1955. Its function is efficient 
implementation and execution of governments scheme and policies regarding the 
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defence and security of the nation in defence departments. There are major four 
departments (Ministry of Defence, n.d.). 

 
Department of  Defence deals in all three services and inter-service organisations 
and staff related to it., defence budget formation, policies, activities and defence 
foreign matters. Departments of defence production deal with weapons, equipment, 
and spare parts, storing and controlling the manufacture of products, Ordnance 
factory board. Department of defence research and Development mostly known as 
DRDO make, designs and do scientific analysis and experiments on weapons and 
required equipment. The last department deals with the pension and well-being of 
retired or ex-service soldiers or staff (Parihar, 2022; Sethi, 2013). 

 
There are many departments which work with the defence ministry like intelligence 
agencies for information and espionage IB and RAW, the national security council, 
the nuclear command authority strategic nuclear command cabinet committee on 
security national security advisory board border road organisation national cyber 
security strategy board (Defence Training Centres, 2012). 

 
Before the freedom, the Britishers used the Indian army as a tool to win the wars 
for them so they only targeted our physical strength and numbers. They have never 
been given good weapons and professional training, leadership quality education, 
officers’ positions, or strategy decisions but were just made to follow orders and 
fight for them like a loyal slave. In fear, we would hamper their mission to empty 
Indian resources and the economy. But we thrived and raised one the most 
powerful military personnel with qualified educations, pro in their fields and 
bravery in the heart: the valiant warriors of India. India spends and raised the 
standards with high educational qualifications, skilled training, rich diet, mental 
ability and toughness. To become a soldier he/she had to clear all parameters from 
mind, soul and body.  The Indian military is one of the biggest employers in the 
world with 2.9 million personnel and spends more than 30% of its defence budget 
on salaries and more than 20% on pensions of defence personnel (Sharma, 2022). 
To train soldiers and aspiring youngsters, the defence ministry builds various 
academies and schools. For example, Rashtriya Indian Military College in 1992 to 
train students to prepare for recruit training in the Indian armed forces; Sanik 
schools in 1961 by V.K Krishna Menon and other military schools in Shimla, Ajmer, 
Bangalore etc.; integrated national institutes like the National Defence College New 
Delhi, College of Defence Management, Military institute of Technology Pune etc., 
Armed Force Medical College specialised for military doctors; then soldiers training 
academies and centres for each service Army, Navy and Air Force (85 for the army, 
31 in the navy and 21 in the air force); 5 training centres for DRDO (PendulumEdu, 

2021). We have specialised units for each task like the border security force to 

protest and guard Indian territory, CISF ensuring the safety of government 
infrastructure, and Indian coastal guard securing maritime security and so on from 
railway protection to natural disaster response force (Security Forces and Agencies 
in India, n.d.). 
 
The number of soldiers doesn’t matter if we don’t have adequate weapons and 
equipment. A nation either can build them by itself or can buy or import them from 
others who are experts in making, designing, manufacturing and production. Before 
independence India bought from British. In India in 1787 a gunpowder factory was 
established in ishapore and a gun carriage agency in Calcutta in 1801. And in 1802 
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it started manufacturing. After that 18 more were made before the independence. 
They produced ammunition, guns, spare parts and armour vehicles. In 1948 it 
came under the defence ministry (The Indian Ordnance Factories, n.d.).  
 
In the last two decades, there have been major changes in the economy related to 
defence: import and export of military supplies, rise in the defence manufacturing, 
economic policies of defence. In 2023-24 ministry of defence has been allocated the 
5,93,537 crore budget (Press Information Bureau, n.d.). As compared to the 
previous year’s budget (2022-23) 5.25 lakh crore, it is seen there is a 13% increase 
this year. Out of 5,93,537 crore, revenue expenditure consists of 2.7 lakh crore 
47%. Revenue expenditure means the expense incurred by the company or in this 
case defence ministry through the course of the production of its goods and services 
(salaries, ammunition, fuel, operating cost, transportation, training, research and 
development etc). Capital allocation is 1.62 lakh crore 28%. Through capital 
allocation, we acquire weapons and military tech (Behera, 2022). In 2022-23 army 
was allocated 32K crore, the navy 47.5K crore and the air force 55.5K crore. But in 
2023-24 army is allocated 37K crore, the navy is 52.8K crore (maximum increase 
according to the previous year), and the air force is 57K crore (highest among other 
services) (Sidhu, 2017), pension 24% (1.38 lakh crore), investment 0.5% (3100 
crores) and defence civil 3.8% (27,601 crores). Noticeable elements border road 
organisation (BRO) has increased by 43% (5000 crores) in 2023-24 which was 
3,500 crores in 2022-23. 9% increase in DRDO amounting to 23,264 crores has 
also occurred. An increase in the non-salary/operational allocation of 27,570 
crores, has increased the total amount to 90,000 crores which was 62,431 crores in 
the previous year. India’s defence allocation is 2% and below its GDP which is 
higher than the previous year’s 2.4% and above 3% is considered good. India’s 
defence budget was continuously increasing in the last consecutive years from 
2,28,172 crores in 2014 to more than 5 lakh crores after 2022. 

 
Boarder road organisation is one of the major players this year as Chinese activities 
have increased near the border. That’s why there is a massive increase in their 
budget (Financial Express, 2023; Singh, 2023). 
 
Currently the focus is on boosting manufacturing in India and pushing towards 
indigenisation, atmanirbhatia. India was always an importer of weapons (The Times 
of India, 2021). About 80% of Indian weapons are of Russian origin. Even now we 
spent 35000 crores on the S-400 air defence missile system. India is a defence 
customer of Russia, Israel, USA, France, UK and Germany etc. Major weapons 
imported by India are boeing-P81, rafale fighter jets, S-400 defence systems, 
aircraft and warships engines and MH 60R helicopters. We were also the largest 
importer of weapons in 2017-21, 11% of total global arms (Waje, 2023; Dutta, 
2022). This puts a burden on our economy (Bommakanti & Patil, 2022). 

 
IV. BOOSTING IN EXPORTS OF INDIA AND MANUFACTURING MADE IN INDIA 

 
This decade there are various changes in defence-related matters. This year and the 
previous year India set aside more than 60% of the military capital budget for 
buying locally produced defence products (India’s Defence Exports, 2022; 
Karthikeyan, 2022). This year SIPRI recorded a decrease of 21%-33% in defence 
imports between 2017-2022: fall of 49% in imports from Russia, 18% from France 
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and 39% from Israel  (Pandit, 2021). Our weapons exports in 2014-15 were 1941 
crores which increased to 11,607 crores in 2021-22, and our goal is to achieve 
35,000 crores by 2025 with help of India’s defence public sector undertaking 
(Mehrotra & Mehrotra, 2020). Under the defence production and export promotion 
policy, we have planned projects to make next-generation fighter jets, hypersonic 
glide vehicles, lightweight tanks, anti-jamming systems, 127mm naval guns, self-
healing minefields etc. indigenously  (8 significant developments in India's defence 
preparedness, 2015; Defence Manufacturing Industry in India, n.d.). We cancelled 
nine defence imports of 46,695 crores to promote made-in-India products. We 
calculated that our expense on imports from foreign has decreased to 36%-46%, 
which reduced the burden on our budget in 2018-22 to help in the allocation of 
money in needed areas. We locally made weapons, warships, fighter jets Tejas, 
nuclear submarines INS Arihant and Vikrant, missiles Akash and Brahmos, and 
laser-guided ATMG which are one of the best weapons in the world (Raghurandan, 
2020; Jha, 2023). 
 
India supplies weapons to 75 countries mainly to USA, Philippines, Egypt, Poland, 
and Spain, countries in south-east Asia, the middle east and Africa and is recorded 
as the 23rd largest exporter among 25 top exporters (India exports these defence 
equipment and systems to the world 'already', 2022). This is an exponential 
increase according to previous years. We exported 155.5 million dollars in artillery 
to friendly nations for a good relationship and an economic boost. In 2020, 40-
million-dollar Swathi weapon location system and Pinaka rocket system were sold 
to Armenia developed by DRDO. 12 high-speed boats were sold to Vietnam on 100 
million dollars in credit, and advance light helicopters were sold to Mauritius police 
force by Hindustan Aeronautics Limited.  
 
V. THE STEP TOWARDS SELF-RELIANCE IS THE EMERGENCE OF THE 
PRIVATE AND PUBLIC SECTORS IN DEFENCE MANUFACTURING 

 
Jindal Defence has collaborated with Brazil Taurus Arms to make small arms. They 
made a joint venture agreement in 2022. Hisar and Haryana are the places where 
they set up plants with an initial investment of 5 million dollars for the starting 
(land and construction). Their main products are 9mm pistols, 5.56×45mm carbine, 
and 7.62×39mm replacement of AK platform guns for the CAPF and Indian armed 
forces (Mattoo, 2022). Joint manufacturing of AK203 rifles in December 2021 
between the Indian Ordnance Factory board and Kalashnikov concern and 
Roseboron export this venture called Indo-Russia Rifles Private Limited and they 
are producing these rifles in Amethi Uttar Pradesh. The project was to make 
6,01,475 7.63×39mm to replace INSAS 5.56×45mm rifles (Philip, 2023). French 
firm Safran and Hindustan aeronautics make helicopter engines (Correspondent, 
2022). A Swedish defence products company SAAB will manufacture Carl-Gustal 
M4 weapon system first time outside Sweden in India in 2024. They will produce 
this weapons system for the army and foreign countries (Jhoshal, 2022). TATA and 
Airbus to produce C295 military planes in India (Sharma S. , 2022). Co-production 
of arms by Indian construction company Puni Llyod and Israel Weapons in 2017, 
was the first joint venture between foreign and Indian defence companies. In 
Malanpur a small arms factory was established named PLR systems, and then they 
had a joint venture with Adani and SK group (Lyer, 2017). Their main products are 
Galil sniper rifles, X95 assault rifles, Tavor assault rifles, and Negev light machine 
guns. A joint venture between India Kalyani Strategic Systems Limited and Israel 
Elbil Systems to manufacture sky strike drones was also undertaken (Israel's IAI 
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inks defence pact with Kalyani Group, 2018). Well, the manufacturing and the 
process with international defence organisations and companies are not as smooth 
because they are ready to set up manufacturing plants and partnerships but don’t 
want to transfer the technology. Private sector is not trusted well by the government 
and want more comfort from the government. But still, the first step towards self-
reliance is a complete success. There are also Indian private sector players in 
defence production like TATA advance system limited, Reliance naval and 
engineering limited, Mahindra, L&T India defence and aerospace and Ashok 
Leyland defence (R., 2023; India Defence Industry, n.d.). This will provide 
employment, increased GDP, less dependency on foreign supplies, infrastructure, 
advanced military power and most important progress towards development (List of 
LOI-IL.pdf, n.d.). 
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